

		WB Mason	Contract Cleaners	General Chemical	Emerald	Central Poly	Interboro						
1	Dish Detergent 12/24 oz bottles	\$ 0.075	ounce	0.093651	ounce	0.179826389	ounce	0.1	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
2	Clorox Bleach Lemon Scent, 4/1 gallon bottle	\$ 0.049	ounce	0.018828	ounce	0.057410468	ounce	0.027285	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
3	Lavender all purpose cleaner 4/1 gal per case	\$ 9.625	gallon	5.205	gallon	5.165	gallon	4.28	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
4	Simple Green, 6/1 gallon bottle	\$ 9.583	gallon	13.05667	gallon	11.52166667	gallon	11.16	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
5	Simple Green, 5 gallon bottle	\$ 45.650	pail	59.29	pail	57.96	pail	58.68	pail	NO BID	pail	NO BID	pail
6	Spray Nine, 6/1 gallon bottle	\$ 10.990	gallon	14.4975	gallon	13.4075	gallon	10.38833	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
7	Endz it digest/spot 4/1 gal	NO BID	gallon	10.3375	gallon	18.2575	gallon	8.7375	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
8	Clorox Toilet Bowl Cleaner 12/24 oz	\$ 0.078	ounce	0.110347	ounce	0.060520833	ounce	0.106458	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
9	Corn Fiber Lobby/Toy Brooms 30"L	\$ 3.250	unit	4.02	unit	4.06	unit	3	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
10	Dust Pans Lobby Pro Upright	\$ 10.450	unit	10.27	unit	8.55	unit	8	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
11	Palmyra Street Broom 16"	\$ 7.500	unit	8.17	unit	10.6	unit	12.5	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
12	Dust Mop 24 x 5	\$ 4.600	unit	4.379167	unit	5.296666667	unit	3.9	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
13	Floor Maintenance Pad 20" black	\$ 2.200	unit	5.282	unit	2.99	unit	2.996	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
14	Floor Maintenance Pad 20" red	\$ 2.200	unit	5.282	unit	2.99	unit	2.996	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
15	Floor Maintenance Pad Xheavy Duty Strip 20" purple	NO BID	unit	8.054	unit	1.05	unit	41.224	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
16	Floor Science Stripper, 2/2.5 gallons	NO BID	gallon	9.4625	gallon	14.194	gallon	72.365	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
17	Floor Wax - one coat 25 Super Hi Gloss 5 gallon	\$ 64.050	unit	NO BID	unit	85.39	unit	64.68	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
18	Folding Floor Signs - caution when wet Yellow 25"h	\$ 7.990	unit	5.59	unit	7.48	unit	8.7	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
19	GAT Graffiti & Spray Paint Remover 12/20 oz	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce	0.199041667	ounce	1.8175	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
20	Lysol Disinfectant Wipes 125 each container	\$ 0.048	unit	0.080712	unit	0.064088889	unit	0.079091	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
21	Lysol Disinfectant Spray Lysol Brand Professional 12/19 oz	\$ 0.332	ounces	0.44943	ounces	0.364736842	ounces	0.418246	ounces	NO BID	ounces	NO BID	ounces
22	Magic Erasers 8/4 ct	\$ 0.931	unit	1.248333	unit	0.979444444	unit	1.054167	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
23	Microfiber Wet Mop Pad Velcro backing 18" 3 in a pack	NO BID	unit	2.55	unit	3.16	unit	2.64	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
24	Metal Mop Handles 12 per case	\$ 6.320	unit	7.24	unit	17.74416667	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
25	Mop Heads 32 oz 12 per case	\$ 3.375	unit	4.535833	unit	5.3825	unit	4.410833	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
26	Mop Heads 24" oz 12 per case	\$ 2.208	unit	2.6125	unit	4.036666667	unit	3.821667	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
27	Hand Soft Soap Antibacterial, 4/1 gallon bottle	\$ 12.050	gallon	16.5775	gallon	6.27	gallon	11.675	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
28	Hand Soap Dispenser Electronic San Jamar Rely Hybrid with manual backup	NO BID	unit	84.65	unit	81.25	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
29	Hand Soap for Zep Plus Dispenser Cherry Bomb, 1 gallon bottle	NO BID	gallon	28.93	gallon	19.76	gallon	29.99	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
30	Purell Hand Sanitizer Dispensers LTX-12 chrome/black (touch free)	\$ 18.500	unit	55.08	unit	34.14	unit	24.96	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
31	Purell Hand Sanitizers bag refills 1200 ML 2 per case for LTX-12 refills	\$ 0.022	ML	0.032421	ML	0.034091667	ML	0.027117	ML	NO BID	ML	NO BID	ML
32	Purell Hand Sanitizer 12/16 oz bottles	NO BID	ounce	0.469514	ounce	0.273020833	ounce	0.321771	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
33	Bucket/sideward Pressure Wringer 16-30oz mop head	\$ 42.000	unit	81.35	unit	44.83	unit	54.95	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
34	Spray Bottles clear 32 oz with triggers	\$ 0.850	unit	0.75	unit	0.8	unit	0.629167	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
34.1	Spray Bottles Trigger*must stay with #34	\$ 0.410	unit	0.9	unit	0.55	unit	0.714583	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit

		WB Mason		Contract Cleaners		General Chemical		Emerald		Central Poly		Interboro	
35	Pledge Furniture Polish Spray 12/9 oz cans	\$ 0.526	ounce	0.516019	ounce	0.133333333	ounce	0.591111	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
36	Presta Sudz Economy Car Wash, 4/1 gallon bottle	\$ 9.563	gallon	NO BID	gallon	15.355	gallon	18.3125	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
37	Resolve Carpet Cleaner 12/22 oz.	\$ 0.179	ounce	0.266856	ounce	0.25875	ounce	0.264583	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
38	Sanitary napkin disposal wax paper liner brown 500 per case	\$ 0.037	unit	0.05174	unit	0.03596	unit	0.0318	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
39	Scotch Brite-medium duty scrub sponge green/yellow 40 per case	\$ 1.528	unit	0.979	unit	0.7485	unit	0.6475	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
40	Squeegees Bucket 20"	\$ 27.450	unit	18.5	unit	30.93	unit	19.18	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
41	Squeegees Pro Stainless Steel Unger 18"	\$ 14.500	unit	20.23	unit	20.23	unit	23.8	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
42	Tech all in 1 (stainless cleaner), 4/1 gallon bottle	\$ 16.313	gallon	NO BID	gallon	Not enough info	gallon	29.22	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
43	Tech all in 1 (stainless cleaner) spray bottles 12/32 oz	\$ 0.202	ounce	NO BID	ounce	Not enough info	ounce	0.228359	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
44	Toilet Bowl Brush & Holder	\$ 3.300	unit	3.79	unit	10.6	unit	3.25	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
45	Toilet Seat Covers 5000/case	\$ 0.006	unit	0.007492	unit	0.006078	unit	0.06008	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
46	Toilet Seat Cover dispensers	\$ 5.000	unit	7.96	unit	11.03	unit	12.25	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
47	Urinal Mats 6 per case	\$ 5.917	unit	5.935	unit	7.433333333	unit	6.261667	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
48	Krystal Deodorizing Urinal Screens 12 per case	NO BID	unit	1.024167	unit	1.728333333	unit	1.0375	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
49	Industrial Plunger 18"	\$ 3.550	unit	3.35	unit	9.58	unit	3.5	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
50	Warehouse Brooms 42"L	\$ 7.500	unit	5.32	unit	7.44	unit	21.41	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
51	Windex 4/1 gallon bottle	\$ 7.250	gallon	12.0875	gallon	10.95	gallon	11.265	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon
52	Husky Cleaner (plexiglass) 1 QT	NO BID	quart	2.56	quart	8.94	quart	NO BID	quart	NO BID	quart	NO BID	quart
53	Vinyl Gloves - powder/latex free S 1,000/case	\$ 0.017	unit	0.02296	unit	0.02246	unit	0.01875	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0172	unit
54	Vinyl Gloves - powder/latex free MED 1,000/case	\$ 0.017	unit	0.02296	unit	0.02246	unit	0.01875	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0172	unit
55	Vinyl Gloves - powder/latex free L 1,000/case	\$ 0.017	unit	0.02296	unit	0.02246	unit	0.01875	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0172	unit
56	Vinyl Gloves - powder/latex free XL 1,000/case	\$ 0.017	unit	0.02296	unit	0.02246	unit	0.01875	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0172	unit
57	Nitrile Gloves X-Large 1,000 per case	\$ 0.031	unit	0.03345	unit	0.03653	unit	0.03328	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0278	unit
58	Nitrile Gloves Large 1,000 per case	\$ 0.031	unit	0.03345	unit	0.03653	unit	0.03328	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0278	unit
59	Nitrile Gloves Medium 1,000 per case	\$ 0.031	unit	0.03345	unit	0.03653	unit	0.03328	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0278	unit
60	Nitrile Gloves Small 1,000 per case	\$ 0.031	unit	0.03345	unit	0.03653	unit	0.03328	unit	NO BID	unit	0.0278	unit
61	Swiffer Sticks 6 per case	NO BID		18.47333	unit	21.65	unit	15.3	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
62	Swiffer Sweeper Dry Cloth Refills 24 /6 per case	\$ 0.260	unit	0.330833	unit	0.368461538	unit	1.867813	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
63	Swifter Duster Handles	NO BID		5.713333	unit	17.07	unit	3.5	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
64	Trash Bags Black 1 Mil 33" x 40" on rolls 100 per case	\$ 0.101	unit	NO BID	unit	0.1451	unit	0.1062	unit	0.131	unit	0.0834	unit
65	Trash Bags Black 1 Mil 40" x 48" on rolls 100 per case	\$ 0.140	unit	NO BID	unit	0.1432	unit	0.1512	unit	0.192	unit	0.1068	unit
66	Trash Bags Black Large 43" x 47" x 2 Mil 100 per case	\$ 0.261	unit	NO BID	unit	0.3517	unit	0.4644	unit	0.18	unit	0.1648	unit
67	Trash Bags Black Small 24" x 33" 1 mil. 1,000 case	\$ 0.065	unit	NO BID	unit	0.05008	unit	0.06664	unit	0.019	unit	0.03582	unit
68	Trash Bags Black 95 gallon 32x29x68 2 mil 50 per case	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit	0.6922	unit	NO BID	unit	0.58	unit	0.4868	unit
69	Trash Bags Clear 40" x 48" 1.0 mil on roll 150 per case	\$ 0.152	unit	NO BID	unit	0.2071	unit	0.17816	unit	0.173333	unit	0.112267	unit

		WB Mason		Contract Cleaners		General Chemical		Emerald		Central Poly		Interboro	
70	Trash Bags Clear 24 x 31 1 mil on rolls 1,000 per case	\$ 0.064	unit	NO BID	unit	0.07414	unit	0.0566	unit	0.021	unit	0.04384	unit
71	Trash Bags Clear 33 x 39 1 mil on rolls 100 per case	\$ 0.087	unit	NO BID	unit	0.1903	unit	0.2372	unit	0.2	unit	0.1482	unit
72	Trash Bags Clear 95 gal (35" X 28" X 70")2.0 Mil 50 per case	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit	2.417	unit	NO BID	unit	1.04	unit	0.8364	unit
73	Rubbermaid Glutton Containers (56 gal trash cans)	\$ 183.000	unit	244.66	unit	263.22	unit	185.02	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
74	Rubbermaid Hooded Tops for Glutton Containers	\$ 182.000	unit	240.57	unit	330.63	unit	181.94	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
75	Hex 45 gallon trash cans	NO BID	unit	199.8	unit	202.23	unit	157.2	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
76	Wastebaskets 28 1/8 black	\$ 3.330	unit	4.71	unit	9.53	unit	4.5	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
77	51" Unger Nifty Nabber trash grabber	\$ 30.840	unit	42.7	unit	41.12	unit	7.56	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
78	Claire Metered Air Freshener Dispensers 8.5" Tall	NO BID	unit	23.36	unit	17.07	unit	13.95	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
79	Spray Air Freshener Metered 12/6 oz cans refills (Claire)	\$ 0.617	ounce	0.567778	ounce	0.563333333	ounce	0.59	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
80	C-Fold Towels white 10 packs of 250 (2,500)	\$ 0.005	unit	0.006683	unit	0.006658333	unit	0.006529	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
81	Diaper Rags White 25lb box	\$ 39.790	box	51.03	box	40.05	box	51.67	box	NO BID	box	NO BID	box
82	Toilet paper 2 ply 4.1" x 3.1" 96/case	\$ 0.226	roll	0.347917	roll	0.339166667	roll	0.293854	roll	0.413125	roll	NO BID	roll
83	Toilet Paper Affex 902 JRT Toilet Tissue 12 per case	\$ 1.568	roll	1.771667	roll	1.333333333	roll	2.2825	roll	2.475	roll	NO BID	roll
84	Dispenser Twin Roll JRT 9"	\$ 34.250	unit	39.33	unit	25.58	unit	17.75	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
85	Toilet Tissue Dispenser Georgia Pacific #59206	\$ 16.550	unit	30.13	unit	26.11	unit	21.5	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
86	Paper Towels White 85 sheets (household brand) 30 rolls per case	\$ 0.007	sheet	0.009384	sheet	0.007760784	sheet	0.683333	sheet	0.666333	sheet	NO BID	sheet
87	Paper Towels Brown Hard Wound 7.9" x 800' 6 per case	\$ 0.003	feet	0.003988	feet	0.003395833	feet	0.004327	feet	0.004998	feet	NO BID	feet
88	Paper Towels White Hard Wound 800' 6 per case	\$ 0.004	feet	0.004654	feet	0.004770833	feet	0.00466	feet	0.005623	feet	NO BID	feet
89	Paper Towel Dispensers San Jamar Electronic Touchless Roll Towels	\$ 99.890	unit	144.56	unit	91.92	unit	147.43	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
90	Rubbermaid Cigarette Receptacle (item #FGR93400BK)	\$ 365.990	unit	459.29	unit	411.95	unit	364.3	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
91	Sanitar Commercial Bagless Vacuum #SC679J Light Weight	\$ 130.000	unit	187.68	unit	153.01	unit	150.3	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
92	Vacuum with attachments	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit	475.08	unit	549.08	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
93	Panasonic type U vacuum bags 9 per bag	NO BID	bag	NO BID	bag	2.665	bag	1.611111	bag	NO BID	bag	NO BID	bag
94	Oreck Commercial Disposable bags #332844 20 packs of 5	NO BID	bag	NO BID	bag	11.386	bags	8.92	bags	NO BID	bags	NO BID	bags
95	Eureka Belts	NO BID	unit	0.55	unit	1.49	unit	9.2	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
96	Steel wool soap pads 2 packs of 18 each	\$ 0.281	unit	0.324667	unit	0.641	unit	0.298	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
97	Power Dust 6/10 oz cans	\$ 0.272	ounce	0.502667	ounce	0.963	ounce	0.324167	ounce	NO BID	ounce	NO BID	ounce
98	Arm & Hammer Commercial Carpet & Room Allergen Reducer & Odor Eliminator 42.6 oz Shake Box	\$ 3.650	unit	5.79	unit	14.97	unit	5.01	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
99	Refill Dusters, Light Blue Unscented 16 per case	NO BID		1.06	unit	NO BID	unit	0.797778	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
100	12" Stainless Steel Squeegee	\$ 12.500	unit	12.51	unit	18.14	unit	19.62	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
101	Baking Soda for Refrig/Freezer 17.6 oz 12 per case	\$ 0.066	ounce	0.008861	ounce	0.105364583	unit	0.074763	ounces	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
102	Catchmaster pro strength glue boards 75 per pack	NO BID		0.4224	unit	0.733333333	unit	0.366667	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
103	Clorox Toilet Wand Disposable Toilet Cleaning Starter Kit	\$ 8.050	unit	13.41	unit	18.84	unit	2.1	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
104	Kleenex Tissues 12 per case	\$ 1.504	box	0.01297	box	0.567333333	box	1.741667	box	NO BID	box	NO BID	box

		WB Mason		Contract Cleaners		General Chemical		Emerald		Central Poly		Interboro	
105	Clorox toilet wand refills 20 per box	\$ 0.539	unit	0.813125	unit	0.834666667	unit	6.233333	unit	NO BID	unit	NO BID	unit
106	Fabuloso all purpose cleaner 4/1gallon per case	\$ 9.625	gallon	13.595	gallon	6.5275	gallon	13.7275	gallon	NO BID	gallon	NO BID	gallon



Low Bidder



Did not bid on specified product



Low bidder, but triggers have to stay with the bottles. Low bid determined by the total of 34 and 34.1